OAK CREEK WATER AND SEWER UTILITY

PROJECT NO. 05106 - 13th Street Water Main Extension

BID TABULATION REPORT

Page 1 of 3

||Bid Date: January 11, 2008 A.W. Oakes & Son, Inc. ReesrnGarr;':irl‘E;(::Ia:‘\::ting & C.W. Purpero, Inc. Undg:)grlr:tl:::tr;:line
Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. [ltem Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 |12" Water Main, Slurry Backfill, Surface Rest. 2,206 LF $124.00| $273,544.00 $127.50|  $281,265.00 $132.00]  $291,192.00 $170.00|  $375,020.00
2 |12" Water Main, 3/4" T.B. Backfill, Surface Rest. 27 LF $110.00]  $2,970.00 $106.00 $2,862.00 $121.00 $3,267.00 $136.00 $3,672.00
3 |6" WaterMain, 3/4" T.B. Backfill, Surface Rest. 114 LF $140.00|  $15,960.00 $92.50 $10,545.00 $156.00 $17,784.00 $220.00|  $25,080.00
4 |12 Gate Valve 50 EA| $182500[ $9,125.00  $1,725.00 $8,625.00(  $1,500.00 $7,500.00[  $1,960.00 $9,800.00
5 |6" Gate Valve 5 EA $800.00[  $4,000.00 $725.00 $3,625.00|| $625.00 $3,125.00|| $1,000.00 $5,000.00||
6 |Hydrant 2 EA| $214500|  $4,290.00(  $2,950.00 $5,900.00|| $2,600.00 $5,200.00|| $3,285.00 $6,570.00
7 |1-1/4" Water Service 79 LF $98.00[  $7,742.00 $102.50 $8,097.50 $110.00 $8,690.00|| $130.00]  $10,270.00
8 |Traffic Control & Access 1 LS| $14,335.00] $14,335.00[ $13,500.00 $13,500.00]  $6,600.00 $6,600.00[  $1,515.00 $1,515.00
9 |Connect to Existing Water Main 3 EA|  $4,32000 $12,960.00|  $1,191.25 $3,573.75]  $3,800.00 $11,400.00  $4,753.00|  $14,259.00
10 |Connect to Existing Water Main (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $3,545.00 $3,545.00 $3,725.00 $3,725.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $3,494.00 $3,494.00
11 |1\/|2.|WV;/5|Z:)Mam Slurry Backfill, Surface Rest. (City of 38 LF $279.00|  $10,602.00 $128.00 $4,864.00|| $132.00 $5,o16.00|| $279.00]  $10,602.00
12 fml\év\’:;i;'\g?'” Slurry. Backfill, Surface Rest. (City of 31 LF $205.00|  $6,355.00 $110.00 $3,410.00 $155.00 $4,805.00 $123.00 $3,813.00
13 [12" Butterfly Valve (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $630.00 $630.00 $355.00 $355.00 $350.00 $350.00 $407.00 $407.00
14 |6" Gate Valve (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $525.00 $525.00 $275.00 $275.00 $135.00 $135.00 $236.00 $236.00
15 |Hydrant (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $420.00 $420.00]  $1,425.00 $1,425.00(  $1,000.00 $1,000.00[  $1,158.00 $1,158.00
16 |Hydrant Removal (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $525.00 $525.00 $950.00 $950.00]  $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $165.00 $165.00
17 |Pavemetn Rest. (City of Milwaukee) 8 SY $100.00 $800.00 $26.75 $214.00 $40.00 $320.00 $126.00 $1,008.00
18 |Sawcutting Pavement (City of Milwaukee) 30 LF $10.00 $300.00 $5.00 $150.00 $3.00 $90.00 $3.00 $90.00
19 |Abandon Water Main (City of Milwaukee) 9 LF $100.00 $900.00 $72.00 $648.00 $62.00 $558.00 $53.00 $477.00
SUB-TOTAL ITEMS 1-19 (inclusive) $369,528.00 $354,009.25 $372,732.00 $472,636.00
oz;?t_ Bﬁggﬁ;;‘;ﬁ igfitlf:\'jlr;?h‘;?sposed 12" Water Main using 2,206 LF (342.00)| ($92,652.00) $0.00 $0.00 No Bid ($41.00)[  ($90,446.00)
02p1t_ ?f-fjv”f;t;Hzmcugﬁgtg’:ﬁcﬁgﬁ?%:ﬁf&nittﬁ!i(?f proposed 1 LS| ($8,835.00) ($8,835.00) $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
TOTAL ITEMS 1-21 (inclusive) $268,041.00 $354,009.25 $372,732.00 $382,190.00
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OAK CREEK WATER AND SEWER UTILITY

PROJECT NO. 05106 - 13th Street Water Main Extension

BID TABULATION REPORT

Page 2 of 3

||Bid Date: January 11, 2008 Mainline S:env‘\;(.er & Water, WiIIkoGn:::ﬁIi);(,:alar\‘lzting & Super Excavators, Inc. DK Contractors, Inc.
Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. [ltem Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 [12" Water Main, Slurry Backfill, Surface Rest. 2,206 LF $130.00( $286,780.00 $163.00 $359,578.00 $205.00 $452,230.00 $245.00 $540,470.00
2 |12" Water Main, 3/4" T.B. Backfill, Surface Rest. 27 LF $128.00 $3,456.00 $119.00 $3,213.00 $150.00 $4,050.00 $142.00 $3,834.00
3 |6" WaterMain, 3/4" T.B. Backfill, Surface Rest. 114 LF $166.00 $18,924.00 $76.00 $8,664.00|| $220.00 $25,080.00 $298.00 $33,972.00
4 |12" Gate Valve 50 EA $2,332.00 $11,660.00 $1,980.00 $9,900.00|| $1,700.00 $8,500.00 $2,136.00 $10,680.00
5 |6" Gate Valve 5 EA $925.00 $4,625.00 $942.00 $4,710.00|| $700.00 $3,500.00|| $1,185.00 $5,925.00
6 |Hydrant 2 EA $2,690.00 $5,380.00 $2,468.00 $4,936.00|| $3,000.00 $6,000.00|| $3,221.00 $6,442.00
7 |1-1/4" Water Service 79 LF $111.00 $8,769.00 $51.00 $4,029.00|| $100.00 $7,900.00|| $223.00 $17,617.00
8 |Traffic Control & Access 1 LS $10,460.00 $10,460.00 $1,163.00 $1,163.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00
9 |Connect to Existing Water Main 3 EA $5,900.00 $17,700.00 $4,408.00 $13,224.00 $3,700.00 $11,100.00 $1,936.00 $5,808.00
10 |Connect to Existing Water Main (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $10,120.00 $10,120.00) $4,604.00 $4,604.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,046.00 $4,046.00||
11 |1\/|2.|WV;/5|Z:)Mam Slurry Backfill, Surface Rest. (City of 38 LF $320.00|  $12,160.00 $232.00 $8,816.00|| $250.00 $9,500.00|| $220.00 $8,360.00"
12 fml\év\’:;i;'\g?'” Slurry. Backfil, Surface Rest. (City of 31 LF $125.00]  $3,875.00 $186.00 $5,766.00 $230.00 $7,130.00 $206.00 $6,386.00
13 [12" Butterfly Valve (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $390.00 $390.00 $852.00 $852.00 $100.00 $100.00 $622.00 $622.00
14 (6" Gate Valve (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $315.00 $315.00 $262.00 $262.00 $100.00 $100.00 $1,185.00 $1,185.00
15 [Hydrant (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $1,100.00 $1,100.00 $560.00 $560.00 $900.00 $900.00 $3,221.00 $3,221.00
16 [Hydrant Removal (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $380.00 $380.00 $464.00 $464.00 $100.00 $100.00 $600.00 $600.00
17 |Pavemetn Rest. (City of Milwaukee) 8 8Y $62.00 $496.00 $114.00 $912.00 $30.00 $240.00 $81.00 $648.00
18 |Sawcutting Pavement (City of Milwaukee) 30 LF $5.00 $150.00 $12.00 $360.00 $1.00 $30.00 $3.90 $117.00
19 [Abandon Water Main (City of Milwaukee) 9 LF $140.00 $1,260.00 $44.00 $396.00 $20.00 $180.00 $608.00 $5,472.00
SUB-TOTAL ITEMS 1-19 (inclusive) $398,000.00 $432,409.00 $546,640.00 $679,405.00
oz;?t_ Bﬁggﬁ;;‘;ﬁ igfitlf:\'jlr;?h‘;?sposed 12" Water Main using 2,206 LF ($1.00)|  ($2,206.00) $0.00 $0.00 ($47.00)| ($103,682.00)  ($104.00)| ($229,424.00)
02p1t. ?f-fjvuvc;t;HzifﬂCﬁﬁgﬁ'ﬁﬁﬁﬁiﬁ:ﬁfﬂnnifﬁﬂi?f proposed 1 LS ($1.00) ($1.00) $0.00 $0.00 ||  ($1,000.00) ($1,000.00)|  ($8,000.00))  ($8,000.00)
TOTAL ITEMS 1-21 (inclusive) $395,793.00 $432,409.00 $441,958.00 $441,981.00
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OAK CREEK WATER AND SEWER UTILITY

BID TABULATION REPORT

PROJECT NO. 05106 - 13th Street Water Main Extension Page 3 of 3
||Bid Date: January 11, 2008 The Wanasek Corp. Rawson Contractors, Inc. Globe Contractors, Inc. DF Tomasini Contractors, Inc
Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. [ltem Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
1 [12" Water Main, Slurry Backfill, Surface Rest. 2,206 LF $200.00 $441,200.00 $205.00|  $452,230.00 $188.00|  $414,728.00 $240.00|  $529,440.00
2 |12" Water Main, 3/4" T.B. Backfill, Surface Rest. 27 LF $165.00 $4,455.00 $170.00 $4,590.00 $155.00 $4,185.00 $180.00 $4,860.00
3 |6" WaterMain, 3/4" T.B. Backfill, Surface Rest. 114 LF $175.00|  $19,950.00 $140.00 $15,960.00) $197.00 $22,458.00) $175.00 $19,950.00)
4 |12" Gate Valve 50 EA $2,150.00[  $10,750.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00] $1,900.00 $9,500.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00
5 |6" Gate Valve 5 EA $1,050.00 $5,250.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $900.00 $4,500.00|| $700.00 $3,500.00
6 |Hydrant 2 EA $2,850.00 $5,700.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00|| $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00||
7 |1-1/4" Water Service 79 LF $40.00 $3,160.00 $75.00 $5,925.00|| $195.00 $15,405.00) $90.00 $7,110.00
8 |Traffic Control & Access 1 LS| $27,000.00] $27,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00]  $25,000.00 $25,000.00]
9 |Connect to Existing Water Main 3 EA $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00) $1,500.00 $4,500.00|| $5,000.00 $15,000.00]
10 |Connect to Existing Water Main (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
11 |1\/|2.|WV;/5|Z:)Mam Slurry Backiill, Surface Rest. (City of 38 LF $220.00[  $8,360.00 $300.00 $11,400.00 $349.00 $13,262.00 $250.00 $9,500.00||
12 fml\év\’:;i;'\g?'” Slurry. Backiill, Surface Rest. (City of 31 LF $200.00[  $6,200.00 $200.00 $6,200.00 $330.00 $10,230.00 $225.00 $6,975.00
13 [12" Butterfly Valve (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,050.00 $1,050.00 $300.00 $300.00 $600.00 $600.00
14 |6" Gate Valve (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $900.00 $900.00 $350.00 $350.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00
15 |Hydrant (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $300.00 $300.00] $2,500.00 $2,500.00
16 |Hydrant Removal (City of Milwaukee) 1 EA $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $600.00 $600.00] $1,000.00 $1,000.00
17 |Pavemetn Rest. (City of Milwaukee) 8 8Y $70.00 $560.00 $65.00 $520.00 $100.00 $800.00 $100.00 $800.00
18 |Sawcutting Pavement (City of Milwaukee) 30 LF $2.00 $60.00 $5.00 $150.00 $2.00 $60.00 $10.00 $300.00
19 |Abandon Water Main (City of Milwaukee) 9 LF $100.00 $900.00 $100.00 $900.00 $30.00 $270.00 $100.00 $900.00
SUB-TOTAL ITEMS 1-19 (inclusive) $545,345.00 $543,275.00 $509,848.00 $650,335.00
oz;?t_ Bﬁggﬁ;;‘;ﬁ igfitlf:\'jlr;?h‘;?sposed 12" Water Main using 2,206 LF ($30.00) ($66,180.00) ($20.00)[  ($44,120.00) No Bid ($40.00)|  ($88,240.00)
02p1t_ ?f-fjv”f;t;Hzmcugﬁgtg’:ﬁcﬁgﬁ?%:ﬁf&nittﬁ!i(?f proposed 1 LS| ($10,000.00) ($10,000.00)| ($2,000.00) ($2,000.00) No Bid ($10,000.00)  ($10,000.00)
TOTAL ITEMS 1-21 (inclusive) $469,165.00 $497,155.00 $509,848.00 $552,095.00
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