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Bid Date:  February 8, 2008

07104 - Chicago Road Transmission Main

Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 30" Water Main, 3/4" T.B. Backfill 2,118 LF $214.00 $453,252.00 $278.00 $588,804.00 $293.00 $620,574.00 $350.00 $741,300.00 $315.00 $667,170.00 $300.00 $635,400.00
2 30" Water Main, Spoil Backfill 42      LF $170.00 $7,140.00 $219.00 $9,198.00 $215.00 $9,030.00 $300.00 $12,600.00 $235.00 $9,870.00 $285.00 $11,970.00
3 30" Water Main, Slurry Backfill -     LF $0.00 $0.00 $382.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $425.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $540.00 $0.00
4 6" Hydrant Assembly and 3/4" T.B. Backfill 1        EA $5,600.00 $5,600.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
5 30" Connection to Existing 36" Water Main at Chicago 1        LS $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,100.00 $5,100.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,650.00 $8,650.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
6 Flushing Station 1        LS $9,100.00 $9,100.00 $8,100.00 $8,100.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $6,560.00 $6,560.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
7 Asphalt Driveway Restoration 150    SY $46.00 $6,900.00 $36.00 $5,400.00 $35.00 $5,250.00 $35.00 $5,250.00 $44.00 $6,600.00 $50.00 $7,500.00
8 Asphalt Roadway Restoration - 3" Binder & 2" Surface 1,555 TN $73.00 $113,515.00 $70.00 $108,850.00 $68.00 $105,740.00 $71.00 $110,405.00 $84.00 $130,620.00 $80.00 $124,400.00
9 Gravel / Shoulder Restoration 507    TN $29.00 $14,703.00 $29.00 $14,703.00 $28.00 $14,196.00 $28.00 $14,196.00 $35.00 $17,745.00 $30.00 $15,210.00
10 Topsoil, Seed, Mulch Restoration 264    LF $6.50 $1,716.00 $10.00 $2,640.00 $8.00 $2,112.00 $10.00 $2,640.00 $7.50 $1,980.00 $10.00 $2,640.00
11 Install Owner Provided Material Sta. 74+99 - 75+94 1        LS $38,600.00 $38,600.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $63,550.00 $63,550.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00
12 Curb and Gutter Restoration 107    LF $35.00 $3,745.00 $30.00 $3,210.00 $35.00 $3,745.00 $30.00 $3,210.00 $48.00 $5,136.00 $35.00 $3,745.00
13 Traffic Control 1        LS $5,300.00 $5,300.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
14 Silt Fence 571    LF $1.40 $799.40 $2.00 $1,142.00 $2.00 $1,142.00 $2.00 $1,142.00 $1.60 $913.60 $2.00 $1,142.00
15 Inlet Protection 1        EA $40.00 $40.00 $100.00 $100.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00 $50.00
16 Triangular Silt Dikes 2        EA $170.00 $340.00 $250.00 $500.00 $250.00 $500.00 $100.00 $200.00 $310.00 $620.00 $100.00 $200.00
17 Excavation and Removal of Contaminated Soil 15      TN $12.00 $180.00 $10.00 $150.00 $20.00 $300.00 $120.00 $1,800.00 $60.00 $900.00 $45.00 $675.00
18 Removal of Contaminated Ground Water 100    GAL $5.00 $500.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $10.00 $1,000.00 $50.00 $5,000.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $15.00 $1,500.00
19 Sod Restoration 150    SY $6.55 $982.50 $10.00 $1,500.00 $7.00 $1,050.00 $8.00 $1,200.00 $8.50 $1,275.00 $10.00 $1,500.00
20 Milling, Shape & compact Asphalt Pavement 4,450 SY $7.00 $31,150.00 $8.64 $38,448.00 $8.00 $35,600.00 $7.00 $31,150.00 $8.70 $38,715.00 $7.00 $31,150.00
21 Temporary Pavement Marking (Paint) 8,000 LF $0.35 $2,800.00 $0.40 $3,200.00 $0.35 $2,800.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $0.40 $3,200.00 $0.50 $4,000.00
22 Permanent Pavement Markings (Epoxy Paint) 8,000 LF $0.50 $4,000.00 $0.50 $4,000.00 $0.50 $4,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $0.60 $4,800.00 $0.50 $4,000.00

Alternative for Steel Pipe (Add or Deduct)

07105 - Raw Water Main

Item Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total Unit Total
No. Item Description Quantity Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price Price

1 36" Water Main, 3/4" T.B. Backfill 66      LF $300.00 $19,800.00 $296.00 $19,536.00 $315.00 $20,790.00 $350.00 $23,100.00 $440.00 $29,040.00 $325.00 $21,450.00
2 36" Water Main, Spoil Backfill 3,105 LF $185.50 $575,977.50 $234.00 $726,570.00 $275.00 $853,875.00 $250.00 $776,250.00 $290.00 $900,450.00 $285.00 $884,925.00
3 4" P.V.C. Water Main 3/4" T.B. Backfill 30      LF $10.00 $300.00 $76.00 $2,280.00 $25.00 $750.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $85.00 $2,550.00 $45.00 $1,350.00
4 4" P.V.C. Water Main Spoil Backfill 2,407 LF $7.00 $16,849.00 $36.00 $86,652.00 $15.00 $36,105.00 $20.00 $48,140.00 $20.00 $48,140.00 $40.00 $96,280.00
5 12" D.I.P. Water Main with Offsets and 3/4" T.B. Backfill 1        LS $7,100.00 $7,100.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
6 4" Gate Valve 1        EA $835.00 $835.00 $900.00 $900.00 $800.00 $800.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $850.00 $850.00 $700.00 $700.00
7 Air Vents - 2" 3        EA $2,200.00 $6,600.00 $3,400.00 $10,200.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,695.00 $8,085.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00
8 Air Vents - 1" 2        EA $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $2,100.00 $4,200.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00
9 Flushing Station 1        LS $7,800.00 $7,800.00 $7,700.00 $7,700.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,650.00 $5,650.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
10 Connection to Existing Water Main at Treatment Plant 1        LS $80,600.00 $80,600.00 $73,000.00 $73,000.00 $43,000.00 $43,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $41,450.00 $41,450.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00
11 Connection to Existing Water Main at Low Lift 1        LS $5,200.00 $5,200.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
12 12" x 4" Connection in 5th Avenue 1        LS $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $1,250.00 $1,250.00 $5,800.00 $5,800.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
13 Work in Low Lift Building - 4" Water Main 1        LS $10,100.00 $10,100.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,600.00 $6,600.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00
14 Asphalt Driveway Restoration 14      SY $113.00 $1,582.00 $106.00 $1,484.00 $102.00 $1,428.00 $102.00 $1,428.00 $129.00 $1,806.00 $120.00 $1,680.00
15 Asphalt Roadway Restoration - 3" Binder & 2" Surface 21      TN $196.00 $4,116.00 $200.00 $4,200.00 $195.00 $4,095.00 $195.00 $4,095.00 $246.00 $5,166.00 $250.00 $5,250.00
16 Gravel / Shoulder Restoration 1        TN $335.00 $335.00 $315.00 $315.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $300.00 $380.00 $380.00 $300.00 $300.00
17 Topsoil, Seed, Mulch Restoration 3,105 LF $14.00 $43,470.00 $6.00 $18,630.00 $8.00 $24,840.00 $10.00 $31,050.00 $23.00 $71,415.00 $10.00 $31,050.00
18 Traffic Control 1        LS $3,800.00 $3,800.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,600.00 $8,600.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
19 Silt Fence 500    LF $1.40 $700.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $2.00 $1,000.00 $1.60 $800.00 $2.00 $1,000.00
20 Inlet Protection 8        EA $40.00 $320.00 $100.00 $800.00 $50.00 $400.00 $50.00 $400.00 $55.00 $440.00 $50.00 $400.00
21 Triangular Silt Dikes 4        EA $170.00 $680.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $250.00 $1,000.00 $105.00 $420.00 $320.00 $1,280.00 $100.00 $400.00
22 Erosion Mat 1,870 SY $1.15 $2,150.50 $4.00 $7,480.00 $1.20 $2,244.00 $5.00 $9,350.00 $1.50 $2,805.00 $5.00 $9,350.00
23 Gravel Tracking Pad 1        EA $1,015.00 $1,015.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00

24 Install 8' Diameter Meter Pit, 24" Meter on Proposed 1        LS $41,300.00 $41,300.00 $59,000.00 $59,000.00 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $57,200.00 $57,200.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00
25 Install 8' Diameter Meter Pit, 24" Meter on Existing Main 1        LS $57,850.00 $57,850.00 $63,000.00 $63,000.00 $58,000.00 $58,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $73,250.00 $73,250.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
26 36" Diameter Butterfly Valves 2        EA $21,300.00 $42,600.00 $24,000.00 $48,000.00 $13,000.00 $26,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $24,420.00 $48,840.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00

Alternative for Steel Pipe (Add or Deduct)

$1,073,827.00
$1,970,916.00

$1,018,333.00
$2,034,476.00

$200,000.00

$1,016,143.00

$1,018,333.00

$125,000.00

$44,000.00

Globe Contractors, Inc.

$993,197.00

$170,000.00

$1,219,135.00

$1,498,792.90 $1,905,742.00 $2,164,061.60 $2,274,217.00

$179,290.00

$1,163,507.00

$1,163,507.00 $1,219,135.00

No Bid

$897,089.00

$185,000.00
$25,000.00 No Bid $6,000.00

$705,362.90 $1,000,554.60 $1,055,082.00

$1,073,827.00

$133,000.00$141,750.00

Willkomm Excavating & 
Grading

$793,430.00

No Bid
$1,000,554.60 $1,055,082.00

$793,430.00

$897,089.00

$17,000.00

$912,545.00
$993,197.00

No Bid

United Sewer & Water, Inc. Rawson ContractorsMainline Sewer & Water, Inc. Super Excavators, Inc.

$5,000.00

Rawson Contractors

$1,016,143.00

Mainline Sewer & Water, Inc. Willkomm Excavating & 
Grading Super Excavators, Inc.

$705,362.90
$15,000.00

Globe Contractors, Inc.

$912,545.00

United Sewer & Water, Inc.

$150,000.00

07105 TOTAL ITEMS 1-23 (inclusive)

07105 ALTERNATE TOTAL ITEMS 24-26 (inclusive)

07104 TOTAL ITEMS 1-22 (inclusive)

07104 TOTAL ITEMS 1-22 (inclusive)

TOTAL 07104 & 07105 
07105 TOTAL ITEMS 1-23 (inclusive)
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