
Oak Creek Water and Sewer Utility
Oak Creek Water Plant Expansion
BID SUMMARY
December 2, 2008  2:00 pm Central time

C.D. Smith Comments J J Henderson JP Cullen Miron Comments Staab
Base Bid

5.2 Lump Sum Bid (sch. A and B) 9,940,000.00$       11,049,000.00$   10,943,682.00$   11,198,000.00$   12,133,000.00$   
5.3 Additive Alternate (Filter 1-6 Rehab) 612,000.00$          566,000.00$        675,000.00$        546,627.00$        765,000.00$        

Subtotal Base Bid 10,552,000.00$     11,615,000.00$   11,618,682.00$   11,744,627.00$   12,898,000.00$   

Alternates
5.4.1.1  Flocculation No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.4.1.2 Plate Settler No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.4.1.3  Filter Underdrain (11-14) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.4.1.4  Butterfly Valves No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.4.1.5  Butterfly Valve Actuators No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.4.1.6  Solids Collectors No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
5.4.2.1  Backwash Tank Composite (28,000.00)$           Gateway Aquastore No Bid No Bid (60,000.00)$        Gateway Aquastore No Bid
5.4.3.1  Filter Underdrain (1-6) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Subtotal Base Bid plus Alternates 10,524,000.00$     11,615,000.00$   11,618,682.00$   11,684,627.00$   12,898,000.00$   

Subcontractors Listed
Mechanical J.F. Ahern
Electrical  Nelco 
Instrumentation and Control  Wunderlich-Malec 
Security System  Wunderlich-Malec 


